




CONTRACTOR Crowder Garney English USC State Utility TA Loving Average
Organized as:
NC LICENSE NO.
BID SUMMARY

$4,353,200.00 $3,838,266.04 $4,541,260.00 $3,300,766.04 $4,500,000.00 $5,224,000.00 $4,292,915.35
$6,445,300.00 $7,410,000.00 $6,484,406.04 $8,819,000.00 $8,652,266.04 $7,930,000.00 $7,623,495.35
$383,975.00 $335,750.00 $1,190,350.00 $189,250.00 $347,750.00 $456,500.00 $483,929.17
$280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00

5) Systems Integrator $2,105,983.96 $2,105,983.96 $2,105,983.96 $2,105,983.96 $2,105,983.96 $2,105,983.96 $2,105,983.96
TOTAL BID AMOUNT $13,568,458.96 $13,970,000.00 $14,602,000.00 $14,695,000.00 $15,886,000.00 $15,996,483.96 $14,786,323.82
Unit Prices

$100.00 $75,000.00 $100.00 $75,000.00 $380.00 $285,000.00 $42.00 $31,500.00 $100.00 $75,000.00 $145.00 $108,750.00 $49,306.09
$130.00 $260,000.00 $100.00 $200,000.00 $380.00 $760,000.00 $65.00 $130,000.00 $100.00 $200,000.00 $145.00 $290,000.00 $140,992.73
$130.00 $39,000.00 $155.00 $46,500.00 $380.00 $114,000.00 $45.00 $13,500.00 $100.00 $30,000.00 $145.00 $43,500.00 $22,177.73
$35.00 $9,975.00 $50.00 $14,250.00 $110.00 $31,350.00 $50.00 $14,250.00 $150.00 $42,750.00 $50.00 $14,250.00 $10,274.55

$383,975.00 $335,750.00 $1,190,350.00 $189,250.00 $347,750.00 $456,500.00
DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATES
Alternate 1 - Metering Pumps NO BID NO BID $200,000.00 Blue White NO BID NO BID NO BID 200,000.00
Alternate 2 - Actuators $300,000.00 EIM $200,000.00 EIM $120,000.00 Rotork $115,000.00 Rotork $200,000.00 EIM $120,000.00 Rotork 175,833.33
Alternate 3 - VFDs $41,450.00 GE NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,000.00 Square D NO BID
Alternate 4 -Aluminum Covers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SUBCONTRACTORS
General Construction Crowder Garney English USC TA Loving
Electrical Construction Crowder Cooper Cooper Cooper Cooper
HVAC Construction Acorn Comfort Engineers Comfort Engineers Comfort Engineers Lee
Plumbing Construction Pipe Tech Pipe Tech Pipe Tech Pipe Tech Keen
Roofing Construction Wayne Roofing Capital City Capital City Triangle Roofing Wayne
Major Equipment
Magnetic Drive Pumps Vanton Vanton Vanton Vanton Vanton Ansimag
Submersible Pumps Fairbanks Fairbanks Fairbanks Fairbanks Fairbanks Fairbanks
Submersible Sump Pumps Hydromatic Hydromatic Hydromatic Hydromatic Hydromatic Hydromatic
In-Line Statc Mixing Statiflo Chemineer Chemineer Chemineer Komax Chemineer
Submersible Mixers Landia Landia Landia Landia Landia Landia
Coarse Bubble Aeration Aquarius Aquarius Aquarius Aquarius Aquarius Aquarius
Tablet Chlorination Axiall Axiall Axiall Axiall Axiall Axiall
FRP Tanks Plas-Tanks Plas-Tank Plas-Tank Plas-Tank Plas-Tank Plas-Tank
Steel Tanks Modern Welding General Industries General Industries General Industries Modern Welding General Industries
MCCs Siemens Square D Square D Square D Square D Square D

1) WAS at North
2) South Durham AB Solids
3) South Digester Solids
4) North Waste Gas Holding Tank

BID TABULATION

1) All Work at North except 3 - 5
2) All Work at South except 3 - 6
3) Total Unit Price Bid Item
4) Contingency Allowance

BID DATE - THURSDAY, JANUARY 16, 2014 @ 2:00 P.M.

SINGLE PRIME CONTRACT NO. 3
NORTH AND SOUTH DURHAM WRF - CHEMICAL SYSTEMS AND NUTRIENT IMPROVEMENTS




