
     City of Durham | North Carolina

To:

Through:

From:

Subject:

Recommendation

1.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

26 # Black Males 1 4%

13 50% # White Males 12 46%

13 50% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 13 50%

# Other Females 0 0%

Bid Report - January 2014

To receive a report and to record into the minutes bids which were acted upon by the City Manager 

during the month of January 2014.

Apparatus, Supplies, Materials, Equipment, Construction and Repairwork:

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Police Department with 35 taser electronic control devices and 

related accessories.

Date: March 4, 2014

Thomas J. Bonfield, City Manager

Wanda S. Page Deputy City Manager

David Boyd, Finance Director

Sue Sandhoff, Financial Operations Manager

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Comments: Lawmen's Safety Supply Inc. is the sole source distributor of the Taser 

International electronic control devices.

Opened:

Bidders: Lawmen's Safety Supply Inc. $40,702.00

12/09/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Taser Electronic Control Devices



2.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

26 # Black Males 1 4%

13 50% # White Males 12 46%

13 50% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 13 50%

# Other Females 0 0%

3.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

26 # Black Males 1 4%

13 50% # White Males 12 46%

13 50% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 13 50%

# Other Females 0 0%

Comments: Lawmen's Safety Supply is the only authorized Smith and Wesson Law 

Enforcement dealer in North Carolina.

Opened:

Bidders: Lawmen's Safety Supply $13,380.00

12/06/13

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To purchase Smith and Wesson M & P Semiautomatic Rifles for the Police 

Department.

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: Ammunition purchase for the Police Department Training Academy.

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Comments: Lawmen's is the sole North Carolina distributor and North Carolina State 

Contract vendor for the Speer brand of ammunition.  Speer manufactures 

ammunition for law enforcement agencies only. North Carolina State Contract 

No. 680A.

Opened:

Bidders: Lawmen's Safety Supply Inc. $22,828.72

12/06/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Smith and Wesson M & P Rifles

TMJ Speer and FMJ Boat Tail Ammunition



4.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

177 # Black Males 41 23%

26 15% # White Males 103 58%

151 85% # Other Males 7 4%

# Black Females 5 3%

# White Females 20 11%

# Other Females 1 1%

5.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

11 # Black Males 2 18%

1 9% # White Males 8 73%

10 91% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 1 9%

# Other Females 0 0%

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: Vulcan Signs $24,444.50

12/31/13

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Transportation Department Sign Shop with high intensity 

preformed street signs (speed limit, directional, stop) and blanks.

Richmond, VA

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Foley, AL

Newman Traffic Signs $29,100.80

Jamestown, ND

Korman Signs, Inc. $26,845.50

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: United Rentals $14,720.00

12/22/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Police Department with two towable light towers.

Garner, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Durham, NC

Coffman Electrical Equipment Co. $15,695.00

Grand Rapids, MI

H & E Equipment Services $15,977.27

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Preformed Road / Street Signs

Light Towers



6.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

10 # Black Males 0 0%

2 20% # White Males 8 80%

8 80% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 2 20%

# Other Females 0 0%

7.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

71 # Black Males 1 1%

17 24% # White Males 21 30%

54 76% # Other Males 32 45%

# Black Females 2 3%

# White Females 5 7%

# Other Females 10 14%

Comments: Pete Duty & Associates is the only authorized regional distributor for the Smith 

& Loveless brand of sewage treatment and transfer equipment and parts.

Opened:

Bidders: Pete Duty & Associates $21,637.00

12/18/13

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide Water Management Facilities / Pump Station Maintenance with a 

Smith & Loveless pump motor for Stagecoach Pump Replacement.

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Police Department with in-car video camera systems and 

accessories.

Digital In-Car Video Systems

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Stafford, TX

Comments: Coban is the sole source manufacturer and distributor of the Coban Edge 

Digital In-Car video system, which integrates into the existing equipment and 

software system utilized.

Opened:

Bidders: Coban Technologies, Inc. $155,860.00

12/18/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Water Pump Motor



8.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

260 # Black Males 3 1%

51 20% # White Males 197 76%

209 80% # Other Males 9 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 49 19%

# Other Females 2 1%

9.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

14 # Black Males 1 7%

2 14% # White Males 10 72%

12 86% # Other Males 1 7%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 2 14%

# Other Females 0 0%

Charlotte, NC

Comments: Pricing from the City of Charlotte Cooperative Purchasing Alliance (CCPA) 

contract No. 1200344.

Opened:

Bidders: Municipal Emergency Services, Inc. $90,794.88

September 14, 2011

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Fire Department with new replacement firefighting protective 

clothing and gear.

Firefighter Protective Clothing

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: Provide the Fleet Maintenance Department with a replacement rolling steel 

service door unit to include electric operator unit.

Rolling Steel Service Door

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Raleigh, NC

Overhead Door Company $12,902.00

Raleigh, NC

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: Fairborn Equipment of North Carolina $12,038.00

12/31/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS



10.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

15 # Black Males 3 20%

1 7% # White Males 11 73%

14 93% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 1 7%

# Other Females 0 0%

11.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

15,437 # Black Males 1,061 7%

5,393 35% # White Males 7,198 47%

10,044 65% # Other Males 1,785 12%

# Black Females 624 4%

# White Females 3,904 25%

# Other Females 865 6%

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide Water and Sewer Operations with replacement water meters.

Water Meters, 5/8" x 1/2"

Raleigh, NC

Diversified Mechanical, LTD $28,800.00

Durham, NC

Neptune Technology Group, Inc. $29,520.00

Comments: 144 meters @ $185.00 each

Opened:

Bidders: H D Supply Waterworks $26,640.00

1/7/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Fleet Maintenance Department with a walk-behind scrubber to 

include accessories and battery / charger kit.

Walk-Behind Scrubber

Tallahassee, AL

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Raleigh, NC

Tennant Sales and Service $14,982.00

Minneapolis, MN

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: W. W. Grainger $14,900.00

1/8/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS



12.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

39 # Black Males 13 33%

16 41% # White Males 10 26%

23 59% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 1 3%

# White Females 15 38%

# Other Females 0 0%

13.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

132 # Black Males 16 12%

19 14% # White Males 97 74%

113 86% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 1 1%

# White Females 18 13%

# Other Females 0 0%

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Police Department with two TACT V8 police vehicles.

Police Vehicles

Beaufort, SC

Ilderton Dodge $49,696.00

High Point, NC

Sir Walter Chevrolet NO BID

Comments: 2 @ $24,673.00 each

Opened:

Bidders: Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $49,346.00

12/12/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Public Works Department - Water / Sewer Engineering Division 

with a cargo van.

Transit XL Cargo Van

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Durham, NC

Capital Ford $21,524.25

Raleigh, NC

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: University Ford $20,650.00

1/8/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males



14.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

39 # Black Males 13 33%

16 41% # White Males 10 26%

23 59% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 1 3%

# White Females 15 38%

# Other Females 0 0%

15.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

39 # Black Males 13 33%

16 41% # White Males 10 26%

23 59% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 1 3%

# White Females 15 38%

# Other Females 0 0%

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $21,203.00

12/12/13

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the General Services Department, Cemetery Division, with a Dodge 

Caravan.

Dodge Caravan

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Beaufort, SC

Ilderton Dodge $21,252.00

High Point, NC

Sir Walter Chevrolet NO BID

Comments: 3 @ $26,369.00 each

Opened:

Bidders: Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $79,107.00

12/12/13

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Fire Department Administration and Fire Prevention Division 

with three new vehicles.

Fire Department Vehicles

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Beaufort, SC

Ilderton Dodge $72,309.00

High Point, NC

Sir Walter Chevrolet NO BID

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males



16.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

47 # Black Males 5 11%

10 21% # White Males 29 62%

37 79% # Other Males 3 6%

# Black Females 1 2%

# White Females 6 13%

# Other Females 3 6%

17.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

31 # Black Males 0 0%

4 13% # White Males 26 84%

27 87% # Other Males 1 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 4 13%

# Other Females 0 0%

18.

Comments: 3 @ $32,876.00 each

Opened:

Bidders: Sir Walter Chevrolet $98,628.00

12/12/13

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Police Department with three patrol vehicles.

Police Department Vehicles

High Point, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Raleigh, NC

Butler Chrysler Jeep NO BID

Beaufort, SC

Ilderton Dodge NO BID

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: Carolina Environmental Systems $73,130.00

1/16/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Neighborhood Improvement Services Department with a 

Knuckleboom Loader to support Impact Team services.

Knuckleboom Loader

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Kernersville, NC

Amick Equipment $75,428.00

McLeansville, NC

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid: Satellite Imagery Mapping



*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

5 # Black Males 0 0%

4 80% # White Males 1 20%

1 20% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 4 80%

# Other Females 0 0%

19.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

15 # Black Males 3 20%

1 7% # White Males 11 73%

14 93% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 1 7%

# Other Females 0 0%

Comments: eMap International is the only known source for this product.

Opened:

Bidders: eMap International $22,985.00

1/16/14

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Public Works Department, Stormwater Division with an updated 

4-band multispectral 50cm resolution custom satellite imagery of the City of 

Durham.  The imagery includes ISM (Impervious Surface Map) which provides 

associated impervious areas for each parcel in the entire city.

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Brevard, NC

Comments: 144 meters @ $185.00 each

Opened:

Bidders: H D Supply Waterworks $26,640.00

1/22/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide Water and Sewer Operations with replacement water meters.

Water Meters, 5/8" x 1/2"

Tallahassee, AL

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Raleigh, NC

Diversified Mechanical, LTD $28,800.00

Durham, NC

Neptune Technology Group, Inc. $29,520.00

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males



20.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

379 # Black Males 22 6%

63 17% # White Males 282 74%

316 83% # Other Males 12 3%

# Black Females 5 2%

# White Females 55 14%

# Other Females 3 1%

21.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

132 # Black Males 16 12%

19 14% # White Males 97 74%

113 86% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 1 1%

# White Females 18 13%

# Other Females 0 0%

Comments: Pricing per IPA National Contract #120377

Opened:

Bidders: Gregory Poole Equipment Company $117,850.00

1/23/14

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department with a hydraulic excavator for 

use by the Distribution / Collections Division.

Hydraulic Excavator

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Raleigh, NC

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: University Ford $20,396.00

1/27/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department with a regular cab pickup truck 

for use by the Distribution / Collections Division.

2014 Ford F150 Regular Cab Pickup Truck

Raleigh, NC

Piedmont Truck Center NO BID

Greensboro, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Durham, NC

Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $22,470.00

Beaufort, SC

Sir Walter Chevrolet $23,904.21

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males



22.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

2 # Black Males 0 0%

1 50% # White Males 1 50%

1 50% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 1 50%

# Other Females 0 0%

23.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

1050 # Black Males 33 3%

79 8% # White Males 865 82%

971 92% # Other Males 73 7%

# Black Females 1 1%

# White Females 74 6%

# Other Females 1 1%

Comments:

Opened:

Bidders: PMC Inc. $20,428.80

1/28/14

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department Facilities / Pump Station 

Maintenance Division with grit chain for use at the South Durham Water 

Reclamation Facility.

Collector Chain 

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Towson, MD

Holland Industrial $21,535.36

Henderson, NC

Comments: 500 units @ $38.25

Opened:

Bidders: East Jordan Iron Works $19,125.00

1/28/14

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department Water and Sewer Operations 

Division with replacement meter box lids.

Plastic Meter Box Lids

Raleigh, NC

TEC Utilities Supply Inc. $23,640.00

Greenville, SC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Apex, NC

Fortiline Waterworks $24,665.00

Concord, NC

Water Works Inc. $27,750.00

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males



24.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

76 # Black Males 4 5%

7 9% # White Males 63 83%

69 91% # Other Males 2 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 6 8%

# Other Females 1 1%

25.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

Opened:

Bidders: Piedmont Truck Center $24,607.00

1/28/14

Bid:

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Transportation Department with a 4x4 Pickup Truck for use by 

the Traffic Operations Division.

2014 Ford F250 4x4 Regular Cab Pickup Truck

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Beaufort, SC

Sir Walter Chevrolet $29,783.65

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Greensboro, NC

University Ford $27,237.00

Durham, NC

Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $27,604.00

Comments:

Opened: 1/28/14

Bidders: Piedmont Truck Center $21,506.00

Greensboro, NC

Bid: 2014 Ford F250 2x4 Regular Cab and Chassis

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department with a 2x4 Pickup Regular 

Cab and Chassis for use by the Meter Maintenance Division.

Comments:

Sir Walter Chevrolet $25,349.55

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

University Ford $23,302.00

Durham, NC

Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $24,385.00

Beaufort, SC



76 # Black Males 4 5%

7 9% # White Males 63 83%

69 91% # Other Males 2 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 6 8%

# Other Females 1 1%

26.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

76 # Black Males 4 5%

7 9% # White Males 63 83%

69 91% # Other Males 2 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 6 8%

# Other Females 1 1%

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Comments:

Opened: 1/28/14

Bidders: Piedmont Truck Center $21,506.00

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid: 2014 Ford F250 2x4 Regular Cab and Chassis

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Transportation Department with a 2x4 Pickup Regular Cab and 

Chassis.

Beaufort, SC

Sir Walter Chevrolet $25,349.55

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Greensboro, NC

University Ford $23,302.00

Durham, NC

Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $24,385.00

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males



27.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

76 # Black Males 4 5%

7 9% # White Males 63 83%

69 91% # Other Males 2 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 6 8%

# Other Females 1 1%

28.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department - Facilities / Pump Station 

Division and the Parks and Recreation Department - Park Clean Up Division 

with 2x4 pickup trucks.

Comments: 2 @ $22,776 each

Opened: 1/28/14

Bid: 2014 Ford F250 2x4 Regular Cab Pickup Trucks

Durham, NC

Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep $52,392.00

Beaufort, SC

Sir Walter Chevrolet $53,969.60

Bidders: Piedmont Truck Center $45,552.00

Greensboro, NC

University Ford $49,210.00

Total # Males

Bid: 2014 Ford F550 4x4 Regular Cabs and Chassis

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department with four regular cab and 

chassis for use by the Distribution / Collections Division.

Comments: 4 @ $34,160 each

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

University Ford $141,628.00

Durham, NC

Butler Chrysler Dodge Jeep NO BID

Beaufort, SC

Opened: 1/28/14

Bidders: Piedmont Truck Center $136,640.00

Greensboro, NC

Sir Walter Chevrolet NO BID

Raleigh, NC

Low Bid



76 # Black Males 4 5%

7 9% # White Males 63 83%

69 91% # Other Males 2 3%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 6 8%

# Other Females 1 1%

29.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

19 # Black Males 0 0%

7 36% # White Males 11 54%

12 64% # Other Males 1 10%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 7 36%

# Other Females 0 0%

30.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid: Truck Service Body

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Transporation Department with a regular duty truck service 

body to be installed on furnished chassis.

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Charlotte, NC

Quality Truck Bodies & Repair Inc. $11,643.00

Elm City, NC

Comments:

Opened: 1/28/14

Bidders: Cook Truck Equipment & Tools Inc. $11,191.00

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid: PG0261 Drive Shaft

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

Bidders: Daparak Inc. $11,723.22

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Water Management Department - Engineering and 

Maintenance Division with a drive shaft for use at the South Durham Water 

Reclamation Facility sludge pumps.

Comments: Daparak Inc. is the sole authorized distributor for Moyno replacement parts in 

the Southeast region.

Opened: 1/28/14

Low Bid



16 # Black Males 1 14%

6 31% # White Males 9 55%

10 69% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 6 31%

# Other Females 0 0%

31.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

9 # Black Males 0 0%

1 11% # White Males 8 89%

8 89% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 1 11%

# Other Females 0 0%

32.

*

*Awarded based on: X Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Opened: 1/29/14

Bidders: Barnhill Equipment Company $31,615.48

Durham, NC

Total # Males

Bid: John Deere Commercial Z-Trak Mowers

Purpose of Bid: To provide the General Services Department with two commercial mowers for 

use by the Cemetery Operations Division.

Comments: 2 @ $15,807.74

Low Bid

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Revels Tool & Tractor $31,858.00

Fuquay-Varina, NC

Comments:

Opened: 1/29/14

Bidders: Revels Turf and Tractor Inc. $22,242.16

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males

Bid: John Deere Utility Tractor

Purpose of Bid: To provide the Parks and Recreation Department with a open operator station 

utility tractor for use at athletic fields.

Low Bid

Fuquay-Varina, NC

Senter Tractor Company Inc. $28,840.00

Raleigh, NC



46 # Black Males 3 6%

5 11% # White Males 38 83%

41 89% # Other Males 0 0%

# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 5 11%

# Other Females 0 0%

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce

Total # Females

Total # Males


