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CITY OF MEDICINE

City of Durham | North Carolina

Date: May 3, 2016

To: Thomas J. Bonfield, City Manager

Through: Wanda S. Page Deputy City Manager

From: David Boyd, Finance Director

Jonathan Hawley, Purchasing Supervisor
Subject: Bid Report - April 2016

Recommendation:

To receive a report and to record into the minutes bids which were acted upon by the City Manager
during the month of April 2016.

Apparatus, Supplies, Materials, Equipment, Construction and Repairwork:

1. Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Replacement Lenovo ThinkPad Tablets

Provides the Technology Solutions Department with fifteen (15) replacement
Lenovo ThinkPad 10 Ultrabook Tablets for the Public Works Department -
Storm Water Maintenance Division.

Priced in accordance with North Carolina State Contract #204A.

15 units @ $1,239.00 each

04/04/2016
Lenovo United States, Inc. * $18,585.00
Morrisville, NC
Low Bid x  Other (See Comments)
WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

3278 # Black Males 168 5%
909 28% # White Males 1818 55%
2369 72% # Other Males 383 12%
# Black Females 110 3%

# White Females 653 20%

# Other Females 146 5%




Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Bid:

Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Replacement Forklift

Provides the Fleet Management Department with one (1) replacement Yale

Veracitor Pneumatic Tire Forklift for the Water Management Department -
Williams Treatment Plant located at 1405 Hillandale Road.

04/04/2016

Gregory Poole Equipment Co.

Raleigh, NC

Southeast Industrial Equipment, Inc.

Raleigh, NC

X Low Bid

Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

1241
174

1067

Remote Mobile Radios

# Black Males
# White Males
# Other Males

# Black Females
# White Females
# Other Females

$28,057.20
$33,265.00

68 6%
958 77%
41 3%
15 1%
150 12%
9 1%

Provides the Durham Police Department with thirty (30) replacement remote
mobile radios and conversion kits to be installed in Durham Police Department

vehicles as part of the Capital Improvement Project for the replacement of
public safety radios citywide.

Priced in accordance with North Carolina State Contract #725G.

30 units @ $4,487.14 each

04/04/2016

Motorola Solutions, Inc.

Charlotte, NC

Low Bid

X

Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

6089
1477

4612

# Black Males
# White Males
# Other Males

# Black Females
# White Females
# Other Females

$134,614.20
222 4%
3352 55%
1035 17%
108 2%
932 15%
437 7%







Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Replacement Diesel Engine

Provides the Fleet Management Department with one (1) replacement diesel
engine to be installed in a 2005 Spartan Advantage Fire Pumper Truck.

04/25/2016

MHC Kenworth
Durham, NC

Cummins Atlantic

Greensboro, NC
Piedmont Peterbilt, LLC
Greensboro, NC

X Low Bid

Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

3904
321

3583 91%

# Black Males
# White Males
# Other Males

# Black Females
# White Females
# Other Females

Replacement Actuator Water Control Valves
Provides the Water Management with three (3) replacement Belk Actuator

water control valves for use as inventory for the Williams Water Reclamation
Facility located at 1405 Hillandale Road.
Harold Beck and Sons Inc. is the sole authorized distributor of Belk actuators,
which are required to support current equipment.

3 units @ $7,240.00 each

04/25/2016
Harold Beck and Sons Inc. *
Newton, PA
Low Bid x  Other (See Comments)
WORKFORCE STATISTICS

CORPORATION STATISTICS

137
20 15%
117 85%

# Black Males
# White Males
# Other Males

# Black Females
# White Females

*

$22,000.00
$22,594.27
$23,864.02

126 3%
3075 78%
382 10%
9 1%
286 7%
26 1%

$21,720.00

2 1%
110 80%
5 4%

0 0%
19 14%




Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Bid:
Purpose of Bid:
Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

# Other Females 1 1%

Replacement Ultraviolet Lamps

Provides the Water Management Department with one hundred twenty eight
(128) replacement Trojan System UV3000 ultraviolet lamps for use at the
North Durham Water Reclamation Facility.

EW2 Environmental, Inc. is the sole authorized distributor of Trojan System
UV3000 replacement parts.

128 units @ $327.52 each

04/25/2016
EW2 Environmental, Inc. * $41,922.56
Charlotte, NC
Low Bid x  Other (See Comments)
WORKFORCE STATISTICS
CORPORATION STATISTICS
8 # Black Males 0 0%
2 25% # White Males 6 75%
6 75% # Other Males 0 0%
# Black Females 0 0%
# White Females 2 25%
# Other Females 0 0%

Replacement Server

Provides the Emergency Communications Department with one (1)
replacement Dell server to support the Computer Aided Dispatch (CAD)
service.

Priced in accordance with North Carolina State Contract #204S.

04/28/2016
Dell Marketing LP * $16,375.22
Round Rock, TX
Low Bid x  Other (See Comments)
WORKFORCE STATISTICS
CORPORATION STATISTICS
35524 # Black Males 1551 4%
11072 31% # White Males 17291 49%
24452 69% # Other Males 5610 16%
# Black Females 1060 3%
# White Females 7500 21%




Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

Bid:
Purpose of Bid:

Comments:

Opened:
Bidders:

*Awarded based on:

Total Workforce
Total # Females
Total # Males

# Other Females 2512 7%

Police Grade Sirens and Light Controls

Provides the Fleet Management Department with fifty-eight (58) police grade
siren and light control vehicle accessories to be installed on 2016 Dodge
Chargers for the Durham Police Department.

58 Units @ $712.79 each

04/28/2016

144th Marketing Group LLC * $41,341.82
Peachtree City, GA

B&G Electronics and Communications, Inc. $47,975.68
Dover, NC

Dana Safety Supply, Inc. No Bid

Greensboro, NC

X Low Bid Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS
CORPORATION STATISTICS

14 # Black Males 0 0%
2 14% # White Males 12 86%
12 86% # Other Males 0 0%
# Black Females 0 0%

# White Females 2 14%

# Other Females 0 0%

Police Grade Vehicle Upfitting Accessories

Provides the Fleet Management Department with police grade upfitting
accessories to be installed on fifty-eight (58) 2016 Dodge Chargers and four
(4) Chevrolet Tahoes for the Durham Police Department.

62 units @ $1,116.34 each

04/28/2016

B&G Electronics and Communications, Inc. * $69,213.08
Dover, NC

Dana Safety Supply, Inc. No Bid
Greensboro, NC

144th Marketing Group, LLC No Bid

Peachtree City, GA

X Low Bid Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS
CORPORATION STATISTICS

7 # Black Males 0 0%
2 29% # White Males 5 71%
5 71% # Other Males 0 0%
# Black Females 0 0%
# White Females 2 29%




# Other Females 0 0%




10. Bid: Police Grade Enclosed Vehicle Consoles

Purpose of Bid: Provides the Fleet Management with fifty-eight (58) replacement police grade
enclosed vehicle consoles to be installed in 2016 Dodge Chargers for the
Durham Police Department.
Comments: 58 Units @ $529.84 each

Opened: 04/28/2016

Bidders: Dana Safety Supply, Inc. * $30,730.72
Greensboro, NC
B&G Electronics and Communications, Inc. No Bid
Dover, NC
144th Marketing Group, LLC No Bid

Peachtree City, GA

*Awarded based on: X Low Bid Other (See Comments)

WORKFORCE STATISTICS
CORPORATION STATISTICS

Total Workforce 100 # Black Males 1 1%
Total # Females 14 14% # White Males 57 57%
Total # Males 86 86% # Other Males 28 28%
# Black Females 1 1%
# White Females 11 11%

# Other Females 2 2%




